

**SHERIFF SALE LIST  
TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 14, 2021 AT 1:30 P.M.  
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM**

<b>CASE NO.</b>	<b>LOCATION</b>	<b>APPRAISED</b>	<b>MINIMUM BID</b>
1. 21CV0055 FIRST NATL BANK OF PA VS SHERRY MAGLIOCCA	2101 GLACIER ROAD NEW SPRINGFIELD, OH 44443 01-171-0-004.02-0	\$118,000.00	<b>\$70,800.00</b> <b>JOSHUA D. ZARLINGO</b>
2. 14CV0208 MAHONING CTY PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE VS TERRY DORSEY ET AL	595 WEST OHIO AVE SEBRING, OH 44672 21-004-0-275.00-0		\$17,000.00 PLUS COSTS <b>NO BID</b>
3. 14CV2189 MAHONING CTY PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE VS NORM RITCHIE ET AL	280 LISBON ST. & LISBON ST. CANFIELD, OH 44406 28-007-0-024.00-0, 28-007-0-025.01-0		\$24,624.03 PLUS COSTS <b>NO BID</b>
4. 19CV2610 GEORGE ZINK VS MICHAEL MCDUGAL & LARRY RINGLER	2197 S SALEM WARREN RD SALEM, OH 44460 50-024-0-019.00-0		\$47,926.26 PLUS COSTS <b>NO BID</b>
5. 20CV0313 DANIEL R YEMMA VS ALTAMESE FLEMING ET AL	209 CLARENCEDALE AVE, LOT 33380 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44512 53-190-0-076.00-0		\$9,000.00 PLUS COSTS <b>NO BID</b>
6. 21CV0265 DANIEL R YEMMA VS ROBERT GRAZIOSI ET AL	631 MABEL STREET LOT 25134 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502 53-113-0-519.00-0		\$9,000.00 <b>\$10,500.00</b> <b>DINEZ BAKER</b>

**NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, SEPTMBER 21, 2021  
NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 28, 2021**